




NOTE: This brief history was prepared by John H. Manwaring, a brother, and was used in talks 
delivered in Relief Society meetings a number of years ago when the history of our composers 
was part of the prepared course of study. These histories were printed in The Improvement Era, 
the one on George Manwaring being written by Mrs. Bertha Stevenson and George D. Pyper of 
the Sunday School Union. 
 
A.C. Smyth appears as the composer of the music for "Joseph Smith's First Prayer." This is 
misleading because it leaves the impression that George Manwaring was the composer of the 
words only, and this is an error. He composed both words and music but A.C. Smyth was 
responsible for the arrangement of the music for printing. This is also true of other songs in the 
S. S. Songbook where musicians appear as joint authors. In several instances George Manwaring 
was deprived of credit as composer because of carelessness on the part of printers or those who 
prepared or arranged the song books. E. Stephens appears as the sole composer of "Gladly 
Meeting, Kindly Greeting" in the 1918 edition of the Songs of Zion, then there was an actual and 
deliberate misappropriation of one song by the Rev. R. Lowry who had the song copyrighted in 
his own name. The song was composed--words and music--by George Manwaring. The Rev. Mr. 
Lowry arranging the music only for publication. 
 
Mention is made of C.C.A. Christiansen of Ephraim, Utah, whose painting The Vision was the 
inspiration for "Joseph Smith's First Prayer." It was on one of his sales trips for the D. O. Calder 
Music Palace that he first saw this painting. He was the guest of artist Christiansen who took him 
into his studio and showed him The Vision which he had just finished. It was a painting of the 
Father and Son appearing to Joseph Smith in the sacred grove in answer to prayer. It made such 
an impression on the mind of George Manwaring, then about 24 years of age, that he was 
inspired to compose the song. As John points out, as long as the song remains in print, the name 
of George Manwaring will never die. The leaders and the preachers of the L.D.S. Church had 
been telling the story of the vision for years and years, but it was left to an English emigrant boy 
to put the story before the members of the church in music and in song. For 48 years the church 
had been content to tell the story from the pulpit but not one musician--and there were many 
talented poets and musicians in the Church--had attempted to tell the story in music and in song. 
Surely, this song came through the inspiration of the Spirit of God, and it will stand as a 
monument to the Church and to the author as long as time shall last. 
 
-George Ernest Manwaring, June 27, 1902 (son of George the songwriter) 


